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the journey begins...
date of corporation

second round of investment funding 
secured

City of Culture 2025 partnership 
announced

first ever customer connected in 
Southampton

Minds Matter fundraiser re-launched 
post-COVID

partnership with Southampton City 
Council for social housing secured

business broadband goes live

 CityFibre partnership announced, 
first customers connect on CityFibre 
network in Portsmouth & Southsea
 100,000 premises passed

connected our 10,000th customer to 
the toob network

toob crowned ‘fastest broadband 
provider in the UK’ by ISPreview

third round of investment funding 
secured

toob crowned ‘Best Urban Fibre 
Provider’ at the UK Fibre Awards

 connected our 20,000th customer to 
the toob network
 toob named ‘SME of the Year’ at 
Central South Business Awards
 toob reaches 200 employees
 Stockton o�ces opened

connected our 50,000th customer  connected our 40,000th customer
 voted ‘Best Value Provider’ in 
Broadband Genie Awards

connected our 30,000th customer

launched our social tari�, toob 
essentials

launched our new refer-a-friend 
scheme with Buyapowa

 connected our 60,000th customer
 one touch switch launched across 
the industry

 connected our 75,000th customer
 launched ‘toob in the community’ 
with OnHand, our new volunteering 
initiative

 ranked 4th in the Sunday Times 
100 Tech
 launched ‘home150’, our even 
more a�ordable tari�

started to expand further across the 
CityFibre network beginning in 
Cambridge, Leicester and Luton 

Portsmouth HQ opened work begins in Southampton

March 2025 April 2025 June 2025

connected our 80,000th customer launched complete wi-fi, our new 
mesh system for extended wi-fi 
coverage

connected our 90,000th customer


